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Cerilliant Introduces New Glucuronide Certified Spiking Solutions®  
 
 

ROUND ROCK, TEXAS – August 2, 2010 - Cerilliant Corporation announces the 
addition of Temazepam glucuronide lithium salt and Mycophenolic acid-β-D-
glucuronide Certified Spiking Solutions®.  Along with six other glucuronide standards 
recently introduced by Cerilliant, these two new standards bring the current offering of 
glucuronide Snap-N-Spike® standards to twenty-one.   
 
The use of glucuronide reference standards is an essential part of clinical testing to 
ensure accuracy in the detection and concentration of metabolized drugs in clinical 
samples whether as part of a urine drug monitoring program, for toxicology analysis, or 
for therapeutic drug monitoring.  Accuracy and reliability of results are critical due to the 
potential clinical, social, and legal consequences. 
 
Temazepam, trade name Restoril, is a benzodiazepine normally prescribed for insomnia 
but also shows anticonvulsant and anti-anxiety effects. Temazepam glucuronide is the 
primary metabolite of Temazepam and may be monitored as part of a urine drug 
analysis to detect Temazepam use.  Mycophenolic acid glucuronide is the major 
metabolite of mycophenolate, an immunosuppressant drug given primarily to transplant 
patients and secondarily to patients with a variety of autoimmune disorders.  Monitoring 
of mycophenolate and its glucuronide metabolite concentrations in serum is part of 
therapeutic drug monitoring programs for ensuring patients remain within the drug’s 
therapeutic range.   
 
Cerilliant Certified Snap-N-Spike® solutions of glucuronides are shelf-stable, highly 
accurate solutions that are suitable for use in the preparation of calibrators or controls in 
clinical or toxicology analysis.  The convenient ready-to-use solution can be spiked into 
a laboratory’s matrix of choice before use eliminating the need to perform painstaking 
weighing operations and reducing waste of valuable reference materials.  They are 
suitable for use in GC/MS or LC-MS/MS analysis and provide laboratories additional 
tools in the specific detection and quantitation of drug levels in clinical samples. 
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Cerilliant also offers Certified Spiking Solutions® of glucuronides of other 
benzodiazepines, various analgesics including several opioids, and other therapeutic 
drugs as well as illicit drugs and alcohol.  Mitzi Rettinger, Cerilliant Vice President, 
commented that “With many laboratories adding LC-MS/MS capability the use of 
glucuronide references allows the laboratory direct analysis of the sample without 
hydrolysis, reducing the time required for sample preparation and the overall uncertainty 
of the analysis.  At Cerilliant we are continually developing products designed to 
address not only laboratories’ testing needs but also their need to push efficiency while 
ensuring accuracy of results.” 
 
 
About Cerilliant     
Cerilliant Corporation, located in Round Rock, Texas, is a global leader in providing 
certified reference standards for critical applications. The company has been providing 
certified reference materials for 30 years. Cerilliant offers more than 3,400 catalog 
products and a full range of custom products and services that address the stringent 
and complex requirements of the clinical/diagnostic, forensic/toxicology, environmental, 
natural products, and pharmaceutical industries. Cerilliant sustains a modern, robust 
quality system which incorporates cGMP, GLP, and ISO requirements.  We are 
accredited to ISO Guide 34 and ISO/IEC 17025 and certified to ISO 9001:2008.  For 
more information about the company, please visit www.cerilliant.com.  
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